CITY OF AMARILLO PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID OPENING SIGN IN SHEET

January 5, 2023

PLEASE READ:

"Pursuant to Local Government Code 252.041 we will open & read aloud all bids that are due to open today. In no way does reading these bids indicate that the bids received are complete and correct. This will be determined only in the bid evaluation phase."

Recap sheets will be posted on website by noon Friday.

Bids will be made available for review after bid opening, by submitting an "open records request" to the Purchasing Agent in writing.

NAME James Brakebill	COMPANY Green Plains Design
NAME Lupe Quiñons	COMPANY COA Purchasing
NAME Jolanda Mendoza	COMPANY LOA
NAME	COMPANY

BID NO. 7404 ANNUAL PURCHASE OF AMMUNITION

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$547.275.13

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$547,275.13			
COMPANY NAME	BID BOND	ADDENDUM	AMOUNT
Deese Firearms			Partial
Deese Firearms GT Distributors, Inc.			Partial Partial
,			
			2 . <
	1		

BID NO. 7410 LIQUID FERROUS CHLORIDE ANNUAL CONTRACT

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$163.216.89

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$163,216.89	DID		AMOUNT
COMPANY NAME	BID	ADDENDUM	AMOUNT
	DOND	ADDENDUM	
Univar USA			No Bid
OFS, Inc.			No Bid 194, 909.49
OFS, Inc. Pencco, Inc. USALCO, LLC			5/5,004.75 No Bid
USALCO, LLC			no Bid
,			

BID NO. 7415 CERTIFIED NFPA COMPLIANT CLASS "B" UNIFORM SUPPLY AGREEMENT

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$30,508.00

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$30,508.00				
COMPANY NAME	BID BOND	ADDENDUM	AMOUNT	
Jonah's Enterprises Inc.			37,025.00	
Jonah's Enterprises Inc. GI Distributors Global Trading, Inc.			37,025.00 28,385.95 30,555-50	
Global Trading, Inc.			30,555-50	
J'			,	

BID NO. 7416 BEST VALUE BID FOR LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE SERVICES FOR THE COLONIES PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT DISTRICT

PROJECT ESTIMATE \$300,000.00

COMPANY NAME	BID		AMOUNT
	BOND	ADDENDUM	
Custom Gardens			335,416.90
Verde Landscape RAMINEZ LAWN & Sprinkler Green Plains Design			335, 416.90 146, 300.00 192, 220.00 195, 302.20
RAMINEZ LAWN & Sprinkler			192,220.00
Green Plains Design			195,302.20
			,
	-		
	-		
	-		